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Key Buttons Instructions

1. Power Button:

• Long press the Power button to turn on the device. When 
turned on, it will take some time to finish initial settings like 
language, time zone, and Wi-Fi setup.

• In any interface, press the power button for one second to 
lock/unlock the interface.

• Long press the power button to access a menu for power 
off, restart, screenshot, or emergency.

2. Volume Button:

• Press the volume button to adjust the volume when playing 
music, radio, or video. The volume button can adjust the 
volume in a circular manner.

• Press the volume button to access the volume bar settings 
for media, calls, ringtone, and alarms.

3. Barcode Scanning Button:

• There are two orange barcode scanning buttons on the left 
and right sides of the device.

• To activate the scanner when it's off, long press any of the 
scanning buttons for 3 seconds.

• Short press the scanning button to scan codes (note: ensure 
a dialog box is open in typing status to display the code 
information).



4. Touch Buttons (from left to right):

• First button: Return to the last running application.

• Second button: Return to the main interface. Long press for 
Google Assistant.

• Third button: Return to a higher-level interface or exit a 
running program.



SIM Card Removal:

Please turn off the device before installing or removing SIM 
cards.

• Open the SIM card cover and take out the tray.

• Insert the SIM card with the chip facing the display.

• Push the tray back into the device.



Battery: Install and Take Out Battery

• Press the right and left buttons simultaneously to remove 
the battery. Ensure that the "FRONT" label faces the display 
when installing.
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Apps & Notifications:

• Accessing Apps: When on the homepage, swipe up to find 
all related apps. Tap the return icon at the bottom of the 
screen to return to the homepage.

• App Settings: Go to "Settings" > "Apps & Notifications" to 
check recently opened apps and default apps. Here, you can 
also set up app permissions for location, microphone, 
camera, etc.



Home Page Management:

1. Expand the homepage:

• The main interface can extend beyond the screen width for 
more space to add new shortcuts, widgets, and other items.

• Swipe horizontally to move to the left or right of the 
expanded homepage interface.

2. Adding Widgets and App Shortcuts:

• Choose widgets and add them to the homepage; they will 
automatically appear in the blank space.

• On the homepage, tap and hold any app icon to drag it to the 
blank space on the homepage.

3. Moving Homepage Icons:

• Tap and hold the icon until the device vibrates.

• While holding, drag the icon to the desired location on the 
homepage.

4. Removing Homepage Icons:

• Tap and hold the icon until the device vibrates.

• Without releasing your finger, drag the icon to the "remove" 
option.

• When all icons and widgets are deleted, the homepage will 
be removed automatically.



Wireless and Network

Wireless Connections:

• The device supports various wireless connections, including     
WiFi, Bluetooth, and mobile data.

• To connect to a WiFi network, go to "Settings" > "Network & 
Internet" > "WiFi," and select your desired network. Enter the 
password if required.

• Bluetooth can be enabled in the "Bluetooth" settings, 
allowing you to pair your device with other Bluetooth-
enabled devices such as headphones, speakers, and 
peripherals.

Mobile Data:

• To use mobile data, ensure that your device has a SIM card 
with an active data plan.

• Navigate to "Settings" > "Network & Internet" > "Mobile 
network" to manage your mobile data settings, including 
data usage tracking and roaming options.

Tethering and Hotspot:

• You can use your device as a mobile hotspot to share your 
mobile data connection with other devices.

• Access the hotspot settings through "Settings" > "Network & 
Internet" > "Hotspot & tethering." You can enable Wi-Fi 
hotspot, USB tethering, or Bluetooth tethering.



VPN (Virtual Private Network):

• If you need to use a VPN for added security or to access 
restricted content, you can configure it in the "Settings" 
under "Network & Internet" > "VPN."

Airplane Mode:

• Use Airplane mode when flying or when you want to disable 
all wireless connections quickly. This setting can be found in 
"Settings" > "Network & Internet" > "Airplane mode."

Network Settings:

• For advanced networking settings, including configuring 
APNs (Access Point Names) for mobile data, managing 
network preferences, and resetting network settings, go to 
"Settings" > "Network & Internet" > "Mobile network" > 
"Advanced."

Display

• Adjust device display brightness, wallpaper, auto-rotate 
screen, sleeping mode, font size, and other display 
functions.

Storage

• Check SD card and relevant mobile phone storage 
information; you can download or format the SD card.

Battery

• View the usage of battery capacity.



Gestures

• Configure system gestures for preventing ringing.

Security & Location

• Set security status, including screen lock and lock screen 
preferences. Lock the screen with a pattern, PIN, or 
password.

• Privacy settings, including location, showing passwords, 
device admin apps, encryption & credentials, trust agents, 
and screen pinning.

Accounts

• Add accounts, configure sync settings, and set background 
data and automatic synchronisation.

Backup & Reset Options

• Access system backup and reset options for factory default 
settings, removing all data on the phone except for system 
software, SD card contents, music, and photos.

Date & Time

• Configure automatic date & time, automatic time zone, and 
use 24-hour format.

Accessibility

• Adjust miscellaneous accessibility functions.



Printing

• Connect devices for printing after installing the necessary 
services.

About Phone

• Check device status, legal information, model number, 
Android version, energy version, kernel version, and build 
number.

USB Connection

• The device offers default charging when connected to a 
computer.

• To copy files or pictures from the device to your computer, 
connect the device with a type-C cable and access the USB 
for file transfer option.

USB Connection

• The device offers default charging when connected to a 
computer.

• To copy files or pictures from the device to your computer, 
connect the device with a type-C cable and access the USB 
for file transfer option.



User’s Manual for Battery:

• Charge the battery when it's low to maximize battery life.

• Avoid excessive charging (over a week) as it can shorten 
battery life.

• Ensure the battery is within the specified temperature range 
for charging.

• Never use the battery for unintended purposes to avoid 
short circuits.

• Do not use a damaged battery.

• Avoid extreme hot or cold environments to maintain battery 
life.

Mobile Phone Layup:

• Keep the phone and accessories away from children.

• Keep the phone dry and away from high temperatures.

• Do not attempt to open or disassemble the phone.

• Use only original accessories to maintain warranty.



Safety Information:

• Observe safety regulations when using the mobile phone, 
including traffic safety, flight safety, and environmental 
safety.

• Follow safety guidelines for system updates and avoid 
unauthorised updates.


